

MAPO 2017-168 Herbicides Bid Summary																							
All prices on this summary are by unit not container.																							
		Agfinity, Inc.		CPS		CPS Professional Products		DBC Irrigation Supply		Frontier Fertilizer		GOLF ENVIRO SYSTEMS, INC.		HELENA		Simplot Partners		Simplot Grower Solutions		Van Diest Supply Company		WINFIELD	
		jthrockmorton@agfinityinc.com 303-659-3643 Jerry Throckmorton		Berne Devlin 720-556-8994 berne.devlin@cpsagu.com		Jeff Elliott 720-346-2287 jeff.elliott@cpsagu.com		Todd Morris 303.981.0788 (Cell) 303.296.8733 (fax) tmorris@dbcirrigation.com		Rhett Osborne 970-587-5105 rhettfertilizer@yahoo.com		Gary Schindlerle 719-590-8884 FAX# 719-590-8885 garys@golfenviro.com		DAVID CROMLEY 720-374-1994 Cromleyd@helenachem.com		Denton Kurtz 970-230-0450 denton.kurtz@simplot.com		David Kothe david.kothe@simplot.com		Chad Clark phone 719-429-1750 fax 888-753-4542 chad.clark@vdscc.com		Jim Taylor 303-408-8090 jtaylor@landlakess.com Fax # 970-535-4467	
DESCRIPTION	UNIT OF MEASURE																						
2,4-D Amine, 4 Lbs. A.I./gal.	1 Gal. Cont.	No Bid	14.24 LPI Amine	14.5/gl	20.22	14.50/Gallon	\$19.60/gal.	21.50 gl	NB	\$	14.00	11.99/gal	\$ 16.90 / GA										
	2.5 Gl Cont.	\$25.95/gl	8.95 Tacoma Ag	11.5/gl	No Bid	10.89/Gallon	19.40/gal.	10.94 gl	NB	\$	13.00	9.57/gal	\$ 14.90 / GA										
	30 Gl Cont.		9.75 Platoon	11.25/gl	No Bid	10.79/Gallon	19.20/gal.	10.79 gl		\$	12.50	9.57/gal	\$ 14.75 / GA										
2,4-D Amine, Aquatic Label, 4 Lbs. A.I./gal.	2.5 Gl Cont.	\$13.95/gl	9.75 Platoon	11.5/gl	No Bid	10.85/Gallon	No bid	10.94 gl	NB			9.57/gal	\$ 14.90 / GA										
	110 Gl Mn Bk	\$14.75/gl	9.90 LPI	10.5/gl	No Bid		No bid	10.49 gl	NB			sub 120 gal returnable 9.39/gal	NO BID										
												sub 250 gal non-rtn 9.39/gal											
Activator 90	2.5 Gl. Cont.	\$27.00/gl	\$14.85	19.80/gl	No Bid	9.75/gallon Alligare 90	\$19.90/gal. Ad-Spray 90	11.59 gl Spret	17.50/g	\$	14.50	no bid	\$ 20.75 / GA										
												sub Brewer 90-10 8.89/gal	Activate Plus 2.5G										
AD Spray 90 Combust/Adjuvant 72% Functional 28% other	2.5 Gl Cont.				No Bid		\$19.90/gal.	17.84 gl	NB	\$	14.50	no bid	NO BID										
												sub Brewer 90-10 8.89/gal											
ALL CLEAR tank cleaner	1 GL Cont.	No Bid	\$13.50	26.85/gl	12.94		\$24.90/gal.	21.64 gl Wipout		\$	30.00	no bid	\$ 38.75 / GA										
	1 QT Cont.				Quart Tank Cleaner Select		Incide-Out Tank Cleaner					sub Combelt Tank Cleaner 19.89/gal	PROTANK CLEANER										
Arsenal	2.5 Gl Cont.	No Bid	\$43.49	80.65/gl	No Bid	55.90/Gallon	No Bid		NB			49.47/gal	\$ 133.72 / GA										
												sub Ecomazapyr 46.97/gal	ARSENAL AC 2.5G										
Arsenal Powerline	2.5 Gl Cont	\$95.50/gl	\$54.50	80.65/gl	No Bid	55.90/Gallon	No Bid		NB			51.47/gal	\$ 73.44/GA										
												sub Ecomazapyr 46.97/gal											
Banner MAXX	1 Gl. Cont.	\$65.05/gl Strider		216/gl	78.79 Propiconazole 14.3 Select		\$216.00/gal.	216.00 gl	216/g		70/g Dorado	216.00/gal	\$ 216.00 / GA										
												sub Quali-Pro Propiconazole 14.3 44.97/gal	BANNER MAXX II										
Bark Oil Blue LT Surfactant	2.5 Gl Cont.	No Bid	\$11.85		No Bid	14.00/Gallon Alligare Basal Oil w/Dye	No Bid		NB			no bid	\$ 9.99 / GA										
												sub JBL Oil Plus with blue dye 11.39/gal	DAMI OIL										
Barrier	50# Bag	\$3.43/lb		3.28/ lb	No Bid		\$188.30/gal.	3.01 #	43.50/# Barrier 50W (4#er)			3.09/lb	\$ 158.50 / BAG										
												sub Casoron 4G 25 LB 2.57/LB											
Cascade	250 gal Tote	No Bid	\$79.58	75/gl	No Bid		No Bid	72.35 gl	48/g			69.90/gal before 3/1/17	NO BID										
												Brilliance (90-120day Wetting Agent)	72.35/gal after 3/1/17										
Casoron 4G	2.5 Gl Cont.			2.90/lb	No Bid		No Bid					3.01 # Barrier G	25 LB Bag 2.57/lb										
													\$ 64.02 / GA										
													CASORON CS 2.5G										
Clear Cast	1 GL	No Bid	\$263.22	263.22/gl	No Bid		\$263.22/gal.	263.22 gl	362.50/q			263.22/gal	263.22 / GA										
ConFront	1 Gl Cont.	\$115.90/gl		134.5/gl	No Bid		\$146.00/gal.	118.22 gl	150/g			112.99/gal	122.97 / GA										
	2.5 Gl Cont.	No Bid					\$146.00/gal.		150/g			no bid	NO BID										
												Quali-Pro 2-D 4x1gal 68.89/gal											
Cool Power	2.5 GL Cont.	\$66.82/gl		59.9/gl	No Bid	68.75/Gallon	\$74.90/gal.	58.99 gl	NB			58.97/gal	\$ 62.95 / GA										
Combelt Guardian	2.5 GL Cont.	No Bid	\$17.00		No Bid		No Bid	12.65 gl	NB			17.90/gal	NO BID										
Cornerstone Plus	2.5 Gl Cont.	\$12.80/gl			No Bid	12.75/Gallon	No Bid		NB			sub Buccaneer Plus 9.89/gal	\$ 12.50 / GA										
Cutrine Plus, Algrecede	30# Bags	No Bid	\$2.25	2.75/lb	No Bid			1.97 #	1.95/#			1.81/bag	\$ 62.10 / BAG										
	5 GL Cont	No Bid	\$24.50	26/gl	No Bid	18.00/Gallon	\$29.40/gal.	23.44 gl	28.50/q			(2x2.5gal) 20.57/gal	\$ 22.61 / GA										
Daconil Action	2.5 Gl Cont.	No Bid		76/gl	No Bid			76.80 gl	76.80/q			76.80/gal	\$ 76.80 / GA										
												sub Echo 720 93.47/gal											

Defoamer	1 Gl Cont.	No Bid	\$24.85 Unfoamer	47.5/gl	30.30 Defoamer Select	8.00/QT Alligare Defoamer	\$18.90/quart Knockdown Anti-foam	27.20 gl Foambuster	12/qt Terminator II		no bid sub Cornbelt 2x2.5gal 23.09/gal	\$ 49.50 / GA FASTBREAK
Dylox	30#bag			1.25/ lb	No Bid		\$41.60/bag	1.16 #	1.33/#		1.11/lb	\$ 39.90 / BAG
DyneAmic Surfactant -	2.5 Gl Cont.	No Bid			No Bid	34.00/Gallon Alligare MVO Plus	\$38.60/gal.	34.76 gl	NB	\$ 30.00 PHT Fastrike	no bid sub Trophy Gold 29.49/gal	NO BID
E-2	2.5 Gl Cont.	No Bid	\$28.24	52.25/gl	No Bid		No Bid	29.44 gl	NB		26.89/gal	NO BID
Element 3a	2.5 Gl Cont.	No Bid		53.55/gl	No Bid	43.45/Gallon Triclopyr 3 SL	No Bid	46.83 gl Carlon 3A	NB		no bid sub Carlon 3A 43.09/gal	\$48.50 / GA
Escort	8 oz.	No Bid	2.21 Escort		No Bid	2.70/OZ	\$140.00/bottle		NB		2.47/oz	\$ 4.05 / OZ
	16 oz.	No Bid	2.21 Escort	6/oz	No Bid	2.70/OZ	\$138.00/bottle	2.80 oz			2.47/oz sub MSM 60 WDG 2.27/oz	\$ 4.05 / OZ ESCORT XP
Esplanade	2.5 Gl Cont.	No bid	\$1,091.84	1091.84/gl	No Bid		\$1069.00/gal.	1091.84 gl	NB		1091.84/gal	\$ 1091.84 / GA ESPLANADE 200 SC
Finale	2.5 Gl Cont.	\$62.50/gl	\$44.09	56.65/gl	61.72 (gal) 154.30 (2.5 gal)		\$63.80/gal.	54.59 gl	63.75/g		51.76/gal	\$ 51.30 / GA
Frequency	1. gal	No Bid	\$746.00	750/gl	No Bid		\$874.00/gal.	754.00 gl	NB		748.49/gal	NO BID
Galleon SC	1 GL 1QT	No Bid	Only Comes in Qts \$59.09 Per Quart	559.09/gl	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	NB		no bid gallons 6x1qts \$59.09/qt	\$ 2063.38 / GA GALLEON SC 2.5G
Gallery SC	1 QT 1 GL	\$171.90/qt \$605.00	\$151.25 \$605.00	151.25/qt	No Bid No Bid	166.40/QT	\$168.00/qt.	151.25 qt + PO More	151.25/qt 605/g		151.25/qt 2x2gal \$605.00/gal	\$ 151.25 / QT \$ 605.00 / GA GALLERY SC 2G
Carlon 3A	2.5 Gl Cont.	No Bid	\$44.69	80.55/gl	No Bid	43.45/Gallon Triclopyr 3 SL	\$58.30/gal.	46.83 gl	NB		43.09/gal	\$ 47.90 / GA
Carlon 4A	2.5 Gl Cont.	No Bid	\$47.79	89.50/gl	No Bid	49.22/Gallon Triclopyr 4 EC Carlon Ultra	\$95.50/gal.	48.78 gl	NB		46.69/gal	\$ 83.30 / GA
Glyphos Aquatic	2.5 Gl Cont.	\$22.15/qt Aqueanet	\$13.95 Aqua Neal	Rodeo 20.55/gl	No Bid	16.75/Gallon Glyphosate 5.4	No Bid	17.90 gl Rup Custom	NB		no bid sub Imitator Plus Aquatic 13.19/gal	\$ 17.36 / GA ROUNDUP CUSTOM
Gordon's SPEEDZONE	2.5 Gl Cont.	\$74.75/gl		72/gl	85.94 (Gal) 214.85 (2.5gal)		\$71.90/gal.	64.24 gl	75/g		62.99/gal	\$ 69.95 / GA
Green Clean Liquid	330 gal tote	No Bid		\$20/gal	No Bid		No Bid	24.69 gl 5.0	NB		no bid	\$ 22.25 / GA GREECCLEAN LIQUID 5.0
Green Clean Pro Tablets/Pellets	50 lb bucket	No Bid		2.38/lb	No Bid		No Bid	2.69 #	NB		no bid	\$ 111.00 / BUCKET
Habitat	2.5 Gl Cont.	No Bid	\$52.50 Polaris	118.75/gl	No Bid	55.90/Gallon Ecomazapyr 2	No Bid	49.44 gl Polaris	NB		82.49/gal sub Ecomazapyr 46.97/gal	\$ 89.50 / GA
Hardball	2.5 Gl Cont.	No Bid			No Bid		\$33.90/gal.	30.55 gl	NB		no bid sub Hi Dep 21.39/gal	NO BID
Hi-Dep	2.5 Gl Cont.	\$26.05/gl	\$23.75	23.35/gl	No Bid	25.50/Gallon	\$28.60/gal.	23.64 gl	NB		21.39/gal	\$ 31.50 / GA
Hi-Light Dye, Blue	1 Quart 1 Gl Cont.	No Bid No Bid	18.50 Big Foot dye	18.51/qt 56.25/gl	13.75 35.00	12.50/QT 31.75/Gallon	\$17.60/quart \$45.50/gal.	16.09 qt 41.44 gl	19/qt - Tracer HD Blue 40/g - Right-On Plus Blue		14.76/qt 37.21/gal	\$ 20.10 / QT \$ 28.50 / GA
	2.5 Gl Cont.	No Bid	32.00 Big Foot Dye	54.17/gl	No Bid	34.00/Gallon	\$43.10/gal.	39.14 gl	40/g - Right-On Plus Blue		35.19/gal	\$ 28.50 / GA
	Dry Pack	No Bid		7.19/pk 40pk/cs	No Bid		\$264.00/case	248.10 case	NB		222.89/case	NO BID
					Turf Mark Blue Select	Alligare Super Marking Dye					sub Big Foot 4x1gal 16.37/gal	MYSTIC SPI BLUE 2.5G
Induce	2.5 Gl Cont.	No Bid	\$28.50 Liberate	Liberate 31/gl	No Bid	9.75/gallon Alligare 90	\$23.90/gal.	20.60 gl	NB		sub Brewer 90-10 8.89/gal	NO BID
Instrata	2.5 Gl Cont.	\$154.55/gl		160/gl >25gl = \$136/gl	No Bid		\$160.00/gal.	160.00 gl	160/g		must take 25 gal in one shipment 25 gal or more 136.00/gal 22.5 gal or less 160.00/gal	\$ 160.00 / GA
Karmex DF	4# Bags	\$4.50/lb	\$3.49	5.10/lb	No Bid	3.54/#	No Bid		NB		no bid	\$ 4.30 / LB

		Diuron				Diuron 80 DF 5#		3.74 # Diuron DF			sub Diuron 80 DF 10x5lb bags 3.39/lb	KARMEK DF 5LB
Krovlar IDF	6# Bags	\$10.50/lb	\$6.85	11.50/lb	No Bid	8.10/# Bromacil 40/40	No Bid	8.00 #	NB		7.19/lb	\$ 10.02 / LB
Matrix	20 oz. Cont.	No Bid		15.54/oz	No Bid	7.50/OZ	No Bid	13.44 oz	NB		15.99/oz	\$ 16.90 / OZ
						Laramie 25DF					sub Laramie 25 DF 8x16oz 7.00/oz	MATRIX SG 20 OZ
Metcel	16 oz	No Bid	\$2.21 Escort	\$3.75/oz	No Bid	2.70/OZ	No Bid	2.80 oz Escort	NB		no bid sub MSM 60 WDG 8oz or 16 oz 2.27/oz	NO BID
						MSM 60 DF						
Milestone	2.5 Gl. Cont. 1 Qt Cont	No Bid	\$277.00 \$70.75	312.50/gl	No Bid No Bid	347.20/Gallon 88.00/QT	\$342.00/gal. \$84.00/quart	277.00 gl 70.75 qt		\$ 301.00 \$ 80.00	277.00/gal 70.75/qt	\$ 312.50 / GA \$ 79.38 / QT
Millennium Ultra 2	2.5 Gl Cont.	\$71.60/gl		66.90/qt	No Bid		\$80.40/gal	63.74 qt	NB		61.69/gal	\$ 67.14 / GA
Monsoon Turf	1 GL Cont.	No Bid		120/qt	No Bid	No Bid		136.50 gl Torque	142/g Torque T&O Fung.		no bid sub Quali-Pro Tebuconazole 3.6 F 41.69/gal	NO BID
MSM60	8 oz	No Bid			No Bid	2.70/OZ MSM 60 DF	No Bid	2.53 oz	NB		2.27/oz	NO BID
MSO	2.5 Gl Cont.	No Bid	\$12.50	17.50/gl	28.49 (Gal) 71.21 (2.5Gal)	12.50/Gallon	No Bid	12.38 gl	40/g Spray-Slick	\$ PHT Pierce 15.00	(Sunwet) 10.49/gal	\$ 31.00 / GA ATMOS
Opensite	1.25 LB CONT	\$99.43/lb	\$87.50	87.50/lb	No Bid	97.25/#	No Bid	87.50 #	NB		87.50/lb	\$ 87.50 / LB
Oust	8 oz	No Bid	\$1.69	2.96/oz	No Bid	1.95/OZ SFM 75	\$52.60/#	2.07 oz	NB		1.77/oz	NO BID
Phycmcin (hydrogen peroxide) for potable water source.	50# Bags	No Bid	\$1.18	1.25/lb	No Bid		No Bid	1.81 #	NB		1.27/lb	\$ 59.00 / BAG GeenClean Pro 50LB
Pendulum Aqua Cap	2.5 Gl. Cont.	No Bid	\$38.00	45.86/gl	59.95 (Gal) 149.88 (2.5Gal)	46.00/gallon	\$67.00/gal.	38.00 gl	44/q		36.29/gal	\$ 59.64 / GA
Pendulum 3.3 EC Industrial Herbicide	2.5 Gl Cont.	No Bid	\$27.50	45.58/gl	38.79 (Gal ) 96.98 (2.5Gal)	32.50/Gallon	\$29.60/gal.	25.43 gl	39/g		26.29/gal	\$ 31.50 / GA
				Pin-Dee 3.3 TO 28.06/gl	Pendulum 3.3.						sub Pin-Dee 4x 1.25gal 25.99/gal	
perspective	oz	No Bid	\$87.04	5.44/oz	No Bid		No Bid		NB		87.04/lb	\$ 108.80 / 20 OZ
	80 oz Cont.	No Bid	\$87.04	87.04/lb	No Bid		No Bid	5.44 oz			87.04/lb	\$ 87.04 / LB
Piper	3.75 lb Cont.	No Bid	\$107.55	93/lb	No Bid	92.00/#	No Bid		NB		5.59/oz	\$ 375.00 / CT
								68.22 # Lockdown				
Plateau 2.01 Lbs. A.1./Gal Imazameth	1 Gl Cont. 2.5 Gl Cont.	No Bid	\$97.00	145/gl	No Bid	102.50/Gallon 101.50/Gallon	\$149.50/gal. No Bid		NB		102.84/gal	\$ 138.90 / GA NO BID
						Panoramic 2 SL		112.69 gl Imazpic 2SL			sub Panoramic 1gal or 2.5gal 98.84/gal Panoramic quart 28.09/qt	
Poast Plus	2.5 Gl Cont.	No Bid	\$78.99	98.54/gl	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	NB		98.54/gal	\$ 98.54 / GA
											sub Volunteer 2lb/gal Clothodim 38.85/gal	
Powerzone	2.5 Gl Cont.	\$66.82/gl Cool Power		74.55/gl	No Bid		\$92.70/gal.	72.44 gl	91.25/q		71.77/gal	\$ 81.60 / GA
Primomax Growth Regulator	2.5 Gl Cont. 1 Gal Cont. 10 Gal Link	No Bid No Bid No Bid			No Bid 290/gl 157.58 274/gl		Not Available \$290.00/gal. \$274.00/gal.	290/q 290.00 gl 274.00 gl	290/q 274/q		no bid 290.00/gal 274.00/gal	148.44 / GA \$ 290.00 / GA \$ 274.00 / GA
					Trin-Pac Select						sub Quali-Pro T-Nex 1AQ 2x1gal 99.09/gal	T-NEX 1 AQ 2.5G
Prokoz Zenith 0.5G Insecticide	30# Bag	No Bid			No Bid		No Bid		25/bag \$0.83/#		.67/lb	NO BID
					Merit SG 1.05/lb						.62 # Criterion SG	
Proxy	2.5 Gl Cont.	\$30.00/gl Ethephon 2SL		31.50/gl	No Bid		\$34.30/gal.34	33.94 qt	34.15/q		29.89/gal	\$ 37.80 / GA
											sub Quali-Pro Ethephon 2SL 26.89/gal	
Q4 Turf Herbicide	2.5 Gl Cont.	No Bid		97/gl	108.65 (GL) 271.60 (2.5 GL)	106.00/Gallon	\$109.00/gal.	90.62 qt	112/q		89.19/gal	\$ 101.50 / GA Q4 PLUS 2.5G
Quicksilver	8oz Bottle	\$132.20/8 oz. bottle		16.50/oz	No Bid		\$123.00/bottle	13.33 oz	144.95/bottle 18.11/oz		14.13/oz	\$ 128.68 / BT
Quinstar	2.5 Gl Cont.	No Bid		182/gl	No Bid		\$35.40/gal. Quinclorac Select 75 DF	28.97 #	150/q		173.29/gal	NO BID

Rangestar	2.5 Gl Cont.		22.75 Riflo D N/A	No Bid	24.00/Gallon	No Bid	35.60 gl	NB	\$	24.00	21.59/gal	NO BID	
	1 Gl	No Bid		Rifle D 22 50/gl	No Bid	Dicamba + D					23.59/gal	NO BID	
Ranger Pro	2.5 Gl Cont.	\$30.45* 100+ miles	\$10.19	12.49/gl	16.78 (GL) 41.95 (2.5 GL)	12.75/Gallon	\$14.90/gal.	11.45 gl	10.83/g		10.24/gal	\$ 11.89 / GA	
Ranger Pro	30 gal	\$17.90 per gallon	\$9.85	12.49/gl	16.47 (GL) 494.12 (30GL)	12.50/Gallon	\$14.50/gal.	11.00 gl	10.83/g		9.84/gal	\$ 11.23 / GA	
		Razor Pro (see line 237)			Glystar Plus	4# Glyphosate					sub Buccaneer Plus both sizes 9.89/gal		
Renovate 3	2.5 Gl Cont.	No Bid	\$101.73	101.73/gl	No Bid	43.45/Gallon	\$99.74/gal.	101.73 gl	NB		101.73/gal sub Carlton 3A 43.09/gal		
		\$36.25/gl			No Bid	Triclopyr 3 SL							
Riverdale Triplet	2.5 Gl Cont.				No Bid		No Bid		NB		(Triplet Low Odor) 31.26/gal	\$ 28.96 / GA	
		Triplet LO		Triplet Low Oder \$37.48/gl				20.46 gl Trimec 992			sub Vessel 19.99/gal	TRIPLET SF 2.5G	
Rodeo	2.5 Gl Cont.	No Bid	\$13.95 Aqua Neat	\$20.55/gl	No Bid	16.75/Gallon	\$34.00/gal.	17.90 gl Rup Custom	NB		18.79/gal Sub Imitator Aquatic 13.19/gal	\$ 21.88 / GA	
						Glyphosate 5.4	AquaStar (generic)						
Roundup (Glyphosate)	2.5 Gl Cont.	\$18.45/gl*less than 100 mi	10.19 Mad Dog Plus	14.60/gal	16.78 (GL) 41.95 (2.5 GL)	12.75/gallon	No Bid		NB	\$	15.99/gal	\$ 17.99 / GA	
		Razor Pro			Glystar Plus	4# Glyphosate		11.45 gl Ranger Pro			sub Buccaneer 5 Extra 12.89/gal	ROUNDUP PRO CONCENTRATE 2.5G	
Roundup Custom			\$17.49		No Bid	12.75/gallon	No Bid	17.90 gl	NB		16.19/gal sub Imitator Aquatic 13.19/gal	\$ 17.36 / GA (2.5G) \$ 16.72 / GA (30G)	
Roundup Pro	2.5 Gl Cont.	No Bid	15.25 \$1.25	14.60/gl	No Bid	12.75/Gallon	No Bid	11.45 gl Ranger Pro	NB		(Max) 26.29/gal	\$ 30.17 /GA PRO MAX 1.67 GA	
	1.5 oz paks (5/box)	\$8.65/box Quick Pro		2.07 (1.5oz) 10.35 (box)	No Bid	4# Glyphosate		8.39 pkg	\$0.95/1.5oz		(Quik Pro) .92/oz	\$ 1.08/OZ QUICK PRO PRO MAX 1.67G	
											sub Roundup Pro Concentrate (5lb) 15.99/gal		
glyphosate pro 160	2.5 Gl Cont.	\$56.10/1.67 gl container	13.99 Mad Dog 5.4		16.78 (GL) 41.95 (2.5 GL)	12.75/gallon	No Bid				Glyphosate Pro 4 9.99/gal	\$ 12.50 / GA	
		Roundup Pro Max		Makaze 11.60/gl	glystar Plus	4# Glyphosate		11.45 gl Ranger Pro			sub Buccaneer Plus 9.89/gal	CORNERSTONE PLUS	
Snapshot_25TG	50# Bag	\$1.62/lb		1.73/lb	80.00 T/1 2.5 G	85.00/Bag 50# Bag	\$68.20/bag 11 2.5G (generic)	1.27 #	1.90/#		1.23/lb	\$ 70.50 / BAG	
Sonar Genesis	1 GL	No Bid	\$272.14	272.14/gl	No Bid		\$310.00/gal.	272.14 gl	272.14/g		272.14/gal	\$ 280.65 / GA	
Speedzone	2.5 Gl Cont.	\$74.75/gl	\$172.50	72/gl	85.94 (GL) 214.85 (2.5 GL)	74.00/Gallon	\$71.90/gal.	64.24 gl	75/g		62.99/lb	\$ 69.95 / GA	
Strike 3	2.5 gal cont	No Bid			No Bid		No Bid	20.46 gl 992	NB		no bid sub Vessel 19.99/gal	\$ 23.65 / GA	
				Trimec 992 28.25/gl									
Spike 20P	25# Bag	No Bid	\$10.04	8.00/lb	No Bid	6.25/#	No Bid	10.90 #	NB		7.74/lb	\$ 210.50 / BAG	
						Tebuthiuron 20P							
Stingrav	1 Qt	No Bid	\$150.14	150.14/qt	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	NB		150.14/qt	\$ 150.14 / QT	
Super Trimec	2.5 Gl Cont.			75/gl	No Bid		\$86.00/gal.	72.20 gl	NB		71.37/gal	\$ 77.13 / GA	
Surfactant 90% A.I., nonionic (Sprayfuse)	1 Gl. Cont.	\$16.20/gl	9.59 Brewer 90/10		No Bid	14.00/gallon	No Bid		17.50/g		(Premier 90) 20.83/gal	\$24.00 / GA	
	2.5 Gl Cont.	Activator 90		Brewer 90/10 10.50/gl	No Bid	9.75/gallon		11.59 gl Spret	Spray-Wet (NIS)	\$	14.50	(Premier 90) 19.79/gal sub Brewer 90-10 2.5 or 1 gal 8.89/gal	ACTIVATE PLUS
Surfactant-LI 700	2.5 Gl Cont.	No Bid	\$27.50	18.50/gl	No Bid	20.00/Gallon	No Bid		29.20/g		no bid sub Access Penetrator 15.59/gal	\$ 24.90 / GA GULFSTREAM	
						Alligare 7		20.50 gl Zandar	Spray 007				
Surflan Liquid	1 Gl Cont.				No Bid						no bid		
	2.5 Gl Cont.	\$44.98/gl	\$39.84	44.50/gl	64.25 (GL) 160.64 (2.5 GL)	Product Limited Please Call For Quote	\$48.60/gal.	44.29 gl	60/g		39.39/gal	\$ 35.15 / GA	
					Oryzalin A S	Oryzalin (generic)					sub Qual-Pro Oryzalin 4 Pro 39.29/gal	SURFLAN FLEX T&O 2.5G	
Surfactant VBS	2.5 Gl Cont.	No Bid			No Bid		No Bid		NB		no bid sub Brewer 90-10 8.89/gal	NO BID	
				LI-700 18.50/gl				11.59 gl Spret					
Telar	16 oz. Cont.	No Bid	\$11.40	17.44/oz	No Bid	12.95/OZ	\$22.00/oz.	13.50 oz	NB		11.89/oz	\$ 16.59 / OZ	
						Chlorosulfuron 75 DF					sub Chlorosulfuron 75 B or 16 oz 11.59/oz	TELAR XP	
Tordon 22K, 2 Lbs. A.I./gal. - Returnable	1 Gl Cont.	No Bid	\$41.09		No Bid	44.40/Gallon	No Bid		NB	\$	60.00	40.97/gal	\$ 70.50 / GA

	2.5 Gl Cont.	No Bid	\$41.09	65/gl	No Bid	44.15/Gallon	\$82.00/gal.	44.44 gl Non Returnable	NB	\$	59.00	40.97/gal	\$ 69.50 / GA
	30 Gl Drum	No Bid	\$41.09	65/gl	No Bid	43.50/Gallon	\$81.00/gal.	44.44 gl Non Returnable	NB			40.97/gal	\$ 68.50 / GA
	1 Qt	No Bid		Tordon RTU 12.34/qt	No Bid	Pictoram 22K	No Bid					Tordon RTU 12.34/qt	NO BID
Tree-age - Emamectin benzoate	1 liter	No Bid			No Bid		No Bid	494.00 liter	NB			no bid	NO BID
												sub Sipcam-Rotam Arbomectin	457.00/qt
Tri Cure Surfactant	2.5 GL cont.	No Bid		Respond 3 47/gal	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	85/g			sub Tournament Ready 5gal	59.55/gal
												no bid	\$ 87.00 / GA
Transline	2.5 Gl Cont.	\$173.50/gl	\$154.00	177/gl	No Bid	137.45/Gallon Clopyralid 3	\$197.00/gal.	127.69 gl	NB			126.69/gal (.5 gal)	\$156.00 / GA
Treflan Granular	40# bag	\$73/lb		1.18/lb	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	NB			no bid	\$ 62.50 / BAG
												sub Trammel 5% G .54/lb	TREFLAN TR-10 50LB
Trimec 992	2.5 Gl Cont.	\$29.70/gl	\$45.00	28.25/ gl	30.61 (GL) 76.53 (2.5GL)	29.00/Gallon	\$26.90/gal.	20.46 gl	26.45/g			20.99/gal	\$ 26.66 / GA
									ProKoz Vessel			sub Vessel 19.99/gal	
Trimec 1000	2.5 Gl Cont.	No Bid		32.70/gl	No Bid	34.45/Gallon	\$36.20/gal.	30.38 gl	NB			29.27/gal	\$ 32.50 / GA
Triplet	2.5 Gl Cont.	\$36.25/gl			No Bid		No Bid		NB			31.26/gal	\$ 28.70 / GA
		Triplet LO		MecAmine D 25.53/gl				20.46 gl '992				sub Vessel 19.99/gal	TRIPLET SF
Triplet Low Odor	30 gal	\$36.25/gl		37.48/gl	No Bid		No Bid	31.64 gl	NB			31.26/gal	\$ 36.07 / GA
												sub Vessel 19.99/gal	
T-Zone	2.5 GL Cont.	No Bid		\$61.45/gl	No Bid	72.00/Gallon	\$68.90/gal.	65.00 gl	64.45/g			65.00/gal	\$ 65.00 / GA
													T-ZONE SE
Vanquish	2.5 Gl Cont.	No Bid	49.00 Strut	60/gl	No Bid	45.40/Gallon	\$72.00/gal.	56.00 gl	NB			47.69/gal	\$ 62.84 / GA
	30 Gl Drum	\$64.36/gl	49.00 Strut	60/gl	No Bid	44.80/Gallon	\$71.00/gal.	55.75 gl	NB			47.39/gal	\$ 62.51 / GA
						Cruise Control						sub Detonate 2x2.5gal 40.89/gal	
Viewpoint	5lb contain	No Bid	\$69.12	65/lb	No Bid	76.80/#	No Bid	69.12 #	NB			69.12/lb	\$ 69.12 / LB
Vista XRT	2.5 Gl Cont.	No Bid	\$123.29	185/gl	No Bid	124.30/Gallon Fluroxypyr	\$219.00/gal.	132.00 gl	NB			122.99/gal	\$ 185.50 / GA
Vision	2.5 GL cont.	No Bid			No Bid		\$109.90/gal.	76.50 gl	NB			no bid	\$ 140.99 / GA
												sub Banvel	35.79/gal
													VISION PRO HD 1G
Weedone LV6 EC 2-4-4 6 lb Lo Vol Easter	2.5 gal cont	\$23.80/gl	\$17.49	17.50/gl	No Bid	18.70/Gallon	\$39.40/gal.	22.50 gl	NB			no bid	\$ 26.00 / GA
		Shredder LV 6#				Low Vol 6# 2.4-D						sub Combelt 6# LV Ester 15.89/gal	SHREDDER 2.4-D LV 6
Weedestroy	2.5 Gl Cont.	No Bid	\$16.50		No Bid	10.85/Gallon 2,4-D Amine	\$18.50/gal.	10.94 gl	NB			no bid	NO BID
												sub Combelt 4lb Amine 9.57/gal	
Wipeout tank cleaner	1 qt	No Bid		Tank Cleaner LPI 5.45/lb	No Bid		\$28.00/gallon 4 x 1 gallon	9.10 qt	13/qt			no bid	\$ 15.25 / QT
									NutraWash II			sub Combelt Tank Cleaner 4x1gal	19.89/gal
													PROTANK CLEANER
Zylam	quart	No Bid		120/qt	No Bid		\$123.00/quart	114.00 qt	115/qt			115.00/qt	\$ 115.00 / QT